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Daily  – Draft                  
 
In the Bench of: Shri Ashok Kumar Borah, Member (Judicial)  

                                                   
 Date:  12th August 2020 
 
1     CA/37/KOB/2020 

 
Learned counsel for the appellant Shri Yogindunath appeared in the VC.  He 
submitted that the appellant company is carrying on its business and it is an ongoing 
concern.  Registry is directed to issue notice to ROC.  List on 24.8.2020 before that 
date ROC is directed to submit his report in this case. 
 
2     CA/38/KOB/2020 

 
Learned counsel for the appellant Shri John Vdassery appeared in the VC.  He 
submitted that the appellant company is carrying on its business and it is an ongoing 
concern.  Registry is directed to issue notice to ROC.  List on 24.8.2020 before that 
date ROC is directed to submit his report in this case. 
 
3     CP/74/KOB/2019 WITH  IA/26/KOB/19  

 
Learned counsel for the petitioner submitted an email seeking an adjournment for 3 
weeks time due to the restrictions imposed in the movements in his residential area, 
which is declared as Containment Zone under Covid 19. Learned Counsel for R3 is 
ready to hear the matter through VC.  No response from other respondents.  List on 
8.9.2020. 
 
4     IA/47/KOB/2020 IN CP/74/KOB/2019 

No response from the applicant in IA.  Learned counsel for R2 submitted an email 
seeking an adjournment for 3 weeks time due to the restrictions imposed in the 
movements in his residential area, which is declared as Containment Zone under 
Covid 19.  Learned counsel for R3 is ready to argue the matter though VC.  No 
response from R1 and R4.  List on 8.9.2020. 
 
5     CP/124/KOB/19 

No response from the petitioner.  Learned PCS for respondents are ready to argue 
the matter through VC.  List on 14.9.2020. 
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6     CP/126/KOB/19 

Learned counsel for the petitioner submitted an email seeking an adjournment for 3 
weeks time due to the restrictions imposed in the movements in his residential area, 
which is declared as Containment Zone under Covid 19..  Learned PCS for the 
respondent is ready to argue the matter through VC.  List on 8.9.2020. 
 
  
7     IA/68/KOB/2020 IN CP/96/KOB/2019  

Learned PCS for the applicants Shri P.P.Zibi Jose as well as learned PCS for the 
respondents Shri Abhilash Nediyalil Abraham in IA appeared in the VC.  Counter and 
Rejoinder filed by the parties are on record.  Heard both the parties.  Reserved for 
orders.  List for pronouncement of orders on 20.8.2020. 
 
 
8     IA/69/KOB/2020 IN CP/97/KOB/2019  

Learned PCS for the applicants Shri P.P.Zibi Jose as well as learned PCS for the 
respondents Shri Abhilash Nediyalil Abraham in IA appeared in the VC.  Counter and 
Rejoinder filed by the parties are on record.  Heard both the parties.  Reserved for 
orders.  List for pronouncement of orders on 20.8.2020. 
 
 
9     IA/70/KOB/2020 IN CA/37/KOB/2019  

Learned PCS for the applicants Shri P.P.Zibi Jose as well as learned PCS for the 
respondents Shri Abhilash Nediyalil Abraham in IA appeared in the VC.  Counter and 
Rejoinder filed by the parties are on record.  Heard both the parties.  Reserved for 
orders.  List for pronouncement of orders on 20.8.2020. 
 
 
10     IA/71/KOB/2020 IN CP/95/KOB/2019  

Learned PCS for the applicants Shri P.P.Zibi Jose as well as learned PCS for the 
respondents Shri Abhilash Nediyalil Abraham in IA appeared in the VC.  Counter and 
Rejoinder filed by the parties are on record.  Heard both the parties.  Reserved for 
orders.  List for pronouncement of orders on 20.8.2020. 
 
 
11     IA/72/KOB/2020 IN CP/94/KOB/2019  

Learned PCS for the applicants Shri P.P.Zibi Jose as well as learned PCS for the 
respondents Shri Abhilash Nediyalil Abraham in IA appeared in the VC.  Counter and 
Rejoinder filed by the parties are on record.  Heard both the parties.  Reserved for 
orders.  List for pronouncement of orders on 20.8.2020. 
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12     IA/73/KOB/2020 IN CA/35/KOB/2019  

 
Learned PCS for the applicants Shri P.P.Zibi Jose as well as learned PCS for the 
respondents Shri Abhilash Nediyalil Abraham in IA appeared in the VC.  Counter and 
Rejoinder filed by the parties are on record.  Heard both the parties.  Reserved for 
orders.  List for pronouncement of orders on 20.8.2020. 
 
13     IA/74/KOB/2020 IN CA/34/KOB/2019  

Learned PCS for the applicants Shri P.P.Zibi Jose as well as learned PCS for the 
respondents Shri Abhilash Nediyalil Abraham in IA appeared in the VC.  Counter and 
Rejoinder filed by the parties are on record.  Heard both the parties.  Reserved for 
orders.  List for pronouncement of orders on 20.8.2020. 
 
 
14     IA/75/KOB/2020 IN CP/93/KOB/2019  

 
Learned PCS for the applicants Shri P.P.Zibi Jose as well as learned PCS for the 
respondents Shri Abhilash Nediyalil Abraham in IA appeared in the VC.  Counter and 
Rejoinder filed by the parties are on record.  Heard both the parties.  Reserved for 
orders.  List for pronouncement of orders on 20.8.2020. 
 
15     CP/02(KOB)/2020  

Learned Senior Counsel for the Petitioner Shri Aravindh Pandian and learned PCS 
for the respondents Shri K.S.Ravichandran appeared in the VC. It Is submitted by 
learned PCS for the respondents that the appeal filed before the Hon’ble NCLAT is 
now posted to 25.8.2020.  List on 8.9.2020 
 
 
16     IA/44/KOB/2020 IN CP/02/KOB/2020 

 
Learned Senior Counsel for the Respondents Shri Aravindh Pandian and learned 
PCS for the applicants Shri K.S.Ravichandran in the IA appeared in the VC. Heard 
the arguments advanced at length by Shri Ravichandran. Learned counsel for 
respondents in IA wants to argue the matter tomorrow.  However, learned PCS for 
the applicants stated some inconvenience on 13th and 14th Aug 2020 and requested 
for a posting for further hearing in the matter on 17.8.2020.  Shri Aravindh Pandian, 
Sr Counsel also agreed and requested for posting on 17.8.2020 at 2 30 PM. List on 
17.8.2020 at 2.30 PM (as part heard). 


